DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
1/18/2006	Meeting with Mr. Cleveland re: proposed Business park update and Perrotta water run-off problem.	0.50
	Meeting with Supervisor Reed and Mr. Adler re: proposed Business Park. (12:30-1:30)	1.00
	Meeting with Supervisor Reed, Messrs. Adler and Cleveland re: proposed Business Park. (1:30-2:00)	0.50
1/23/2006	Attendance at Planning Board meeting re: Park/Subdivision Reg. Findings	0.50
2/3/2006	Meeting with Town Planner re: Subdivision Regs., Kellogg Rd.utility pole. (8:30- 9:00)	0.50
2/9/2006	Meeting with Joe Yagey, Cleveland, Back & Schwenzfeier re: Site Plan Review parameters with telephone call to Assoc. of Towns (Affy.Harry Willis). (10:45 - 11:30)	0.75
3/10/2006	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds & Cleveland re: G.E.I.S. and other planning matters (9:00- 1 1:00).	2.00
3/14/2006	Meeting with Cleveland re: planning issues.	0.50
4/19/2006	Review materials and information from Highway Sup. Cleveland re: GEIS	0.75
	Review info re: Rte. 5/5A corridor - GEIS Pos. Dec.	0.40
5/11/2006	Meeting with Cleveland and memo to Town Board re: Woods Rd. Bus. Park.	0.30
	Meeting with Cleveland re: Planning Board procedures, greenwaste management, GEIS, Applewood Water District, Woods Rd. Bus. Park	0.60
7/20/2006	Telephone conference with Hans Amold re: Planning Board issues.	0.30
	Research SEQR process.	0.75
7/31/2006	Prep. memo to Planning Board re: SEQR process.	0.40
8/2/2006	Meeting with Cleveland and Schwenzfeier re: SEQR process. (9:30 - 10:00)	0.50
	Memo to Planning Board re: SEQR process.	1.00
8/3/2006	Revisions to Planning Board memo re: SEQR process.	0.40
8/4/2006	Revisions to Planning Board memo re: SEQR process.	0.40
8/11/2006	Telephone conference with Hans Amold re: Planning Board Matters	0.40
9/5/2006	Meeting with Schweizfeier re: Planning matters.	0.20

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
9/13/2006	Cursory Review 1992 GEIS Study.	0.40
10/2/2006	Telephone conference with Town of Colonie Atty Zilgne re: GEIS and FILM.	0.40
10/11/2006	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: GEIS and FILM.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Bob Mitchell re: GEIS.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Arnis Zilgne re: GEIS.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Bob Mitchell re: GEIS.	0.10
10/28/2006	Prep. for meeting with Town of Colonie officials re: GEIS/FILM.	0.75
10/30/2006	Travel to and from Colonie and meeting with Town of Colonie offrcials re: GEIS/FILM (8:30 - 3:30).	4.50
11/10/2006	Telephone conference with Amold re: planning Board issues.	0.40
11/15/2006	Telephone conference with Arnold re: Planning Board matters.	0.30
12/7/2006	Review Planning Board minutes.	0.20
1/17/2007	Telephone conference with Amold re: Planning matters.	0.30
1/24/2007	Telephone conference with Picente re: meeting with Reed to discuss Bus. Park and Preswick Glen	0.30
	Meeting with Reed and Picente re: Preswick Glen and Business Park.(12:00- 1:00)	1.00
3/1/2007	Telephone conference with Adler, Reed and Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.40
3/8/2007	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland, Schwenzfeier re: Business Park, HRWD (0.20), Griffo Grant, Court renovations, CFO, DOT Meetings. (9:30-11:30)	2.00
	Telephone conference with Brian Adde, Sen. Griffo's office, re: Business Park/Griffo Grant.	0.30
	Letter to Griffo by Earle C. Reed re: Griffo Grant.	0.30
	Telephone conference with Brian Adde, Sen. Griffo's office re: Griffo Grant.	0.30
3/12/2007	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland, Schwenzfeier and DOT Ofhcials re: New Hartford Business Park. (10:30-11:30)	1.00

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
3/14/2007	Telephone conference with Arnold re: Planning issues	0.30
3/15/2007	Memo to Town Board re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
3/22/2007	Meeting with Government officials, Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland and Schwenzfeier re: New Hartford Business Park. (9:30-10:30)	2.00
3/22/2007	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
3/23/2007	Memo to Town Board re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
5/10/2007	Telephone conference with Adler/Valenti re: DEC/Hartford Ins. Matter .	0.40
5/16/2007	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Ryan Developers, Cleveland and Schwenzfeier(. 8:30-10:00)	1.50
6/1/2007	Telephone conference with Mark at Ryan Developers re: The Hartford/ DEC matter. (.50)	0.50
6/12/2007	Meeting with Picente, Reed, Reynolds, Schwenzfeier, Cleveland and Ryan re: DEC matter. (7:30-8:45)	1.25
6/14/2007	Telephone conference with Adler re: DEC matter	0.40
	Telephone conference with Adler re: DEC matter.	0.50
	Meeting with DEC, Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland and Schwenzfeier. (8:30-3:00)	6.50
	Telephone conference with Adler re: meeting with DEC.	0.40
6/18/2007	Telephone conference with Adler re: DEC matter	0.20
7/3/2007	Telephone conference with Adler re: N.H. Business park	0.40
7/16/2007	Telephone conference with Adler re: N.H. Bus. park/DEC.	0.20
8/3/2007	Meeting with Reynolds, Cleveland, Adler and Schwenzfeier re: Business Park - Map correction and Break-in-access.(8:30-9:30)	1.00
8/21/2007	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.40
	Meeting with Reed, Schwenzfeier, Carol (P.J. Smith) and Smith re: GEIS, Updates, New Hartford Business Park, SDG Website work.	2.00
9/5/2007	Meeting with Meagher and Planner re: GEIS F.I.L.M.	0.50
9/6/2007	Memo to Town Board re: GEIS F.I.L.M.	0.40
9/7/2007	Telephone conference with Meagher re: Stormwater Management Maintenance Agreement/Greg Humphrey and proposed Quitclaim Deed Woods Road area.	0.20
9/10/2007	Meeting with Meagher and Planner re: Stormwater Management	

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Maintenance Agreement and Quitclaim Deed	1.00
9/11/2007	Meeting with Planner, Meagher and atty. Schmitt re: Quitclaim Deed and DEC Consent Order. (8:00-9:00)	1.00
9/12/2007	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park	0.20
9/13/2007	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: DEC Consent Order and F.I.L.M.	0.30
9/14/2007	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Planner amd Cleveland re: DEC Consent Order and F.I.L.M. (12:00-1:30)	1.50
9/17/2007	Meeting with Back, Adler and Planner re: New Hartford Business Park	0.50
	Meeting with Back, Adler, Planner and Hans Arnold re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.75
	Meeting with Hans Arnold, Schwenzfeier and Reed re: GEIS F.I.L.M., New Hartford Business Park, Town office space and Humphrey's airport.	0.50
9/25/2007	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: Stormwater Management Maintenance Agreement, New Hartford Business Park, GEIS, Longworth Acres.	0.30
9/25/2007	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: Stormwater Management Maintenance Agreement, New Hartford Business Park, GEIS, Longworth Acres.	0.30
9/26/2007	Meeting with Cleveland, Planner re: New Hartford Business Park, DEC Consent Order, Longworth Acres, Sitrin letter from Wilson, Ken Bart matter. (9:30-11:30)	2.00
	Telephone conference with Town Clerk re: Board minutes (New Hartford Business Park).	0.20
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: Board minutes (New Hartford Business Park).	0.20
	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park	0.40
9/27/2007	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: DEC and Business Park	0.30
	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
	Telephone conference with Plannerr re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
10/10/2007	Conversation with Planner and Booth re: New Hartford Business Park	0.20
	Memo to Arnold re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
10/12/2007	Telephone conference with Planner re: New Hartford Business Park, Consumer Square, Longworth Acres.	0.30

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
10/13/2007	Meeting with Councilman Reynolds re: Stormwater Committee, Budget Process, New Hartford Business Park, Administrative matters. (9:45-11:00)	1.25
10/15/2007	Telephone conference with Booth re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
10/16/2007	Telephone conference with Booth re: Heinrich and New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
10/18/2007	Meeting with Reed, Arnold, Booth, Planner, Meagher and Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park. (8:00-10:00)	2.00
	Meeting with Reed to discuss Lawrence F.O.I.L. appeal, New Hartford Business Park, Stormwater Management and Press Releases	1.00
	Telephone conference with Booth re: New Hartford Business Park	0.40
10/19/2007	Meeting with Planner, Meagher and Booth re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.75
	Meeting with Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
10/22/2007	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park	0.40
10/31/2007	Telephone conference Adler re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
11/2/2007	Meeting with Cleveland re: FILM, DEC Consent Order, New Hartford Business Park	0.90
11/3/2007	Telephone conference with Planner re: Lowe's Snow Removal Agreement, Wal-Mart Subdivision, PILOT program New Hartford Business Park, Benderson Bond and related issues, Staff oversight on New Hartford Business Park.	0.75
11/14/2007	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
11/16/2007	Meeting with Cleveland, Reed, Reynolds r : DEC Consen t Order, New Hartford Business Park, Planning Board Appointments.	1.50
11/19/2007	Meeting with Cleveland re: Fariello matter, Longworth Acres and New Harford Business Park.	0.30
11/21/2007	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park, DEC Consent Order, IMA with New York Mills.	0.40
11/30/2007	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: BAN for Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Atty. Tom Myers re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park	0.10
12/30/2007	Telephone conference with Town Planner re: Business Park/B.O.C.E.S., Consumer Square.	0.20

1/10/2008	Telephone conference with Dan Gilligan re: T.I.F. New Hartford Business Park.	0.40
1/11/2008	Telephone conference with atty. Myers re: New Hartford Business Park	0.20
	Meeting with Gilligan, Reynolds, A dler, Saunders C, alli, Di Meo, Cleveland, Nole re: New Hartford Business Park. (1:30-3:00)	1.50
1/14/2008	Memo to Town Board re: New Harford Business Park	0.30
	Memo to Town Board re: Planning Board.	0.30
1/16/2008	Meeting with Gilligan, Reynolds, Adler, Calli, Nole, Basile, DiMeo re: New Hartford Business Park. (3:45-6:00)	2.25
1/17/2008	Telephone conference with atty. Myers re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.50
	Telephone conference with atty. Saunders re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.50
	Memo to Town Board re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
1/18/2008	Review of Allocation Agreement re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.50
	Meeting with Cleveland, Reynolds and Krupa re: Allocation Agreement for New HartfordB usinessP ark. (1:00-1:45)	0.75
	Meeting with Gilligan, Calli, Nole, Shields, Reynolds, Adler, Basile, Cleveland, Krupa and Saunders re: New Hartford Business Park (2:00-4:3	2.50
1/21/2008	Memo to Town Board re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.40
	Meeting with Reed, Basile, Reynolds re: New Hartford Business Park including call to Cleveland. (12:00-4:00)	4.00
	Meeting with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park. (8:00-10:00)	2.00
1/22/2008	Telephone conference with Basile re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
	Telephone conference with atty. Myers re: New Hartford Business Park	0.20
	Telephone conference with Assessor Smith re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
	Revisions to memo to Town Board re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.50
	Telephone conference with atty. Myers re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.50
	Telephone conference with Arnold re: Zoning matters.	0.40

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park	0.10
	Telephonec onferencew ith AssessorS mith re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Basile re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Picente, DiMeo, Reed, Reynolds, D'Onofrio, Dillon, Fiorrini, Smith, Cleveland Gilligan, et. al. (11:00-1:00)	2.00
	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
1/23/2008	Telephone conference with Assessor Smith re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
	Meeting with Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park	0.50
1/24/2008	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park, RR Crossing fees and IMA	0.30
	Telephone conference with Basile re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Adler re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
1/25/2008	Telephone conference with Basile re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Assessor Smith re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Planner re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Planner re: New Hartford Business Park	0.20
1/28/2008	Memo to Town Board re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.40
	Memo to Basile re: scheduling of meeting	0.00
	Telephone conference with atty. Myers re: New Hartford Business Park	0.30
	Telephone conference with Basile re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
1/29/2008	Telephone conference with Town Planner re:New Hartford Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: New Hartford Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Town Board re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
1/30/2008	Attendance at Public Information meetins re: New Hartford Business	

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Park. (7:00-8:30)	15.00
1/31/2008	Telephone conference with Basile re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.20
	Memo to Basile re: New Hartford Business Park	0.30
	Memo to atty. Myers re: New Hartford Business Park.	0.30
2/1/2008	Meeting with Griffo, Reed, and Adler re:N H Business Park.(1-3)	2.00
	Memo to Basile re:NH Business Park.	0.30
	Telephone conference with D'Onofrio re:NH Business Park.	0.40
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: Consumer Square and NH Business Park	0.20
	Telephoneco nferencwe ith Basiler e:N H BusinessP ark	0.10
2/4/2008	Telephone conference with Adler re: NH Business Park.	0.30
2/7/2008	Telephone conference with Basile re: FO.I.L. Responses and NH Business Park.	0.30
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: NH Business Park and Equipment.	0.30
2/8/2008	Telephone conference with Basile re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park.	0.40
	Review of revised Allocation Agreement re :N .H. Business Park.	0.20
2/11/2008	Telephone conference with attorney Saunders re: Allocation Agreement.	0.75
	Prep of status report re: N.H. Business Park.	0.50
	Telephone conference with Basile re:N .H. Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Attorney Myers and Basile re: N.H. Business Park.	0.75
	Telephone conference with Booth re: N.H. Business Park.	0.40
2/12/2008	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Adler re: N.H. Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Basile re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
2/13/2008	Letter to attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park	0.30

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone conference with attorney Shields re: N.H. Business Park and Applewood Tax Cert Matter.	0.40
	Telephone conference with Basile re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Meeting with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park (1 1:45- 1).	1.25
	Telephone conference with Basile re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
2/18/2008	Review of correspondence and memo to Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park,	0.30
2/20/2008	Telephone conference with Steve DiMeo re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Adler re: N.H. Business Park.	0.60
2/21/2009	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
	Telephone conference with Ron Wargo re: N.H Business Park.	0.10
	Review and analysis of revised PAA re: N.H. Business Park.	0.40
	Telephone conference with attorney Shields re: N.H. Business Park PAA	0.10
	Telephone conference with attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park PAA	0.40
	Memo to Town Board re: N.H. Business Park PAA	0.30
2/22/2008	Meeting with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Arnold re: Consumer Square and N.H. Business Park.	0.75
	Telephone conference wih Planner re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
	Meeting with Alder re: N.H. Business Park.	1.00
2/25/2008	Meeting with Planner, Booth, Meagher, and Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park.	0.40
	Telephone conference with attorney Shields re: PAA.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Ron Wargo re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Planner re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone conference with Adler re: N.H. Business Park.	0.50
	Telephone conference with attorney Shields re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Memo to Planner re: N.H. Business Park.	0.20
2/26/2008	Meeting with Basile and Reed re:N .H. Busines Park.	2.00
	Meeting with Basile, Reynolds, Cleveland, Krupa, and Adler re:N .H. Business Park (6:30-9)	2.50
2/27/2008	Telephone conference with Cleveland re :N .H Business Park.	0.40
	Telephone conference with Adler re:N .H. Business Park	0.30
	Meeting with Booth and Reed re: Copyrighted materials, minor subdivisions, Preswick Glen, N.H. Business Park, F.I.L.M.	1.00
2/28/2008	Telephone conference with attorney Livingston re: N.H. Business Park	0.50
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: Sale of Van and N.H. Business Park.	0.30
	Telephone conference with Basile re: N.H. Business Park.	0.40
2/29/2008	Meeting with attorney Shields and attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park.(9:30-12:30).	3.00
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park.	0.50
3/3/2008	Legal research re: N.H. Business Park (legal avoidance of bid process)	0.20
	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H. Business park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Joe Girardi re: N.H. Business park.	0.50
	Memo to Town Board re: N.H. Business Park	1.00
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds and Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park.	0.75
3/4/2008	Meeting with Reed, Gilligan, Reynolds, Cleveland and Basile re: N.H. Business Park.(12-1:30)	1.50
3/5/2008	Meeting with Picente re: DEC Consent Order and N.H. Business Park.	0.75
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: IMA water issue for Business Park	0.40
3/6/2008	Meeting with Reynolds re: N.H. Business Park and IMA.	1.00
	Telephone conference with Gilligan re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
3/10/2008	Telephone conference with Planner re: F.I.L.M. and G.E.I.S.	0.30
	Memo to Cleveland, Planner and Meagher re: F.I.L.M.	0.30
	Review of information provided by Cleveland re: COR Traffic Signal and 840 Break in access.	0.20

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone conference with Booth re: N.H. Business Park and Sign Code Resolution.	0.30
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: IMA with NY Mills and N.H. Business Park.	0.10
3/12/2008	Meeting with Cleveland and Planner re: N.H. Business Park and IMA with NY Mills. (9:30-11)	1.50
3/13/2008	Review of P.I.L.O.T. Asreement for The Hartford re: N.H. Business Park	0.40
	Meeting with Reynolds re: IMA with NY Mills and N.H. Business Park. (1-3)	2.00
3/17/2008	Prep status report re: N.H. Business Park.	1.50
	Memo to Town Board re: N.H. Business Park.	0.20
	Memo to Town Board re: Hartford P .I.L.O.T Agreement	0.20
3/18/2008	Telephone conference with Reed, Reynolds and Adler re: N.H. Business Park	1.00
	Meeting with Adler and Basile re: N.H. Business park	0.00
3/21/2008	Telephone conference with Planner re: N.H. Business Park and COR Traffic Signal	0.30
3/24/2008	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: DEC matter, COR Signal, and N.H. Business Park.	0.50
3/27/2008	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Telephone conference with Saunders re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
	Meeting with Adler re: N.H. Business Park.	2.00
3/28/2008	Meeting with Cleve;amd.with telephone calls to Linda Lubey (DOT), and Girardi(COR) re: COR Signal FIILM, and N .H. Business Park. (10-12)	2.00
	Memo to Town Board re: FILM- Seneca Turnpike	0.30
	Telephone conference with Planner re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
3/29/2008	Review and analysis of signed Hartford P.I.L.O.T., Prime Lease, Leaseback Agreement, Guaranty Job Agreement and Allocation Agreement re: N.H. Business Park.	2.00
3/31/2008	Prep status report re: N.H. Business Park.	3.00
	Meeting with Picente re: N.H. Business Park.	0.40
	Telephone conference with Smith re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park,	

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Longworth Acres, Jubilee Estates, Bid Specifications.	0.40
	Telephone conference with Basile re: N.H. Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with Pat (Ryan Cos.) re: Fire District- N.H. Business Park	0.10
4/1/2008	Telephone conference with Attorney Saunders Re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
	Telephone conference with Steve DiMeo Re: N.H. Business Park	0.40
	Telephone conference with Attorney Livingston Re:The Hartford	0.10
4/2/2008	Meeting with Smith Re: N.H. Business Park	0.75
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland and Planner Re: N.H. Business Park (3-4 p.m.)	1.00
	Telephone Conference Adler Re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Adler and Cleveland Re: N.H. Business Park (3-5 p.m.)	2.00
4/4/2008	Meeting with Meagher, Planner & Cleveland Re: N.H. Business Park	1.50
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers Re: N.H. Business Park	0.40
4/7/2008	Meeting with Reed and Reynolds Re: N.H. Business Park	0.75
	Meeting with Gilligan Re: N.H. Business Park	1.00
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers Re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
4/8/2008	Memo to Town Board Re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Memo to Christine Krupa Re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Prep Board Resolution Re: N.H. Business Park	2.50
4/9/2008	Revisions to Resolution and prep for public presentation re: N.H. Business Park	2.00
4/10/2008	Memo to Attorney Myers Re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Town Clerk Re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Revisions to Legal Notice of Estoppel Re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
4/14/2008	Memo to Town Board Re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
4/16/2008	Memo to Attorney Myers Re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Gilligan Re: N.H. Business Park	0.40
4/17/2008	Meeting with Cleveland and Reynols re: N.H. Business Park and Stormwater Drainage Project-Jubilee Estates	0.40

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
4/21/2008	Memo to Town Board Re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Memo to Booth, Cleveland, Planner and Meagher	0.30
	Revisions to PILOT Allocation Agreement re: N.H. Business Park	3.00
4/22/2008	Revisions to PILOT Allocation Agreement re: N.H. Business Park	2.00
	Revisions to PILOT Allocation Agreement re: N.H. Business Park	2.00
	Telephone conference with Attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park Letter of Credit	0.20
	Telephone conference with Laura Ruber (BSK) re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
4/23/2008	Memo to Attorneys Saunders and Shields re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Memo to Town Board Re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Revisions to PILOT Allocation Agreement re: N.H. Business Park	1.00
4/24/2008	Telephone Conference with Basile re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone conference with Attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
	Telephone conference with Gail Young re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone conference with Dan Gilligan re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone conference with Attorney Saunders/DiMeo re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
4/25/2008	Memo to Saunders, Shields & Dillion re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Allocation Agreement	0.10
4/29/2008	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Shields re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
5/2/2008	Revisions to PILOT Allocation Agreement re: N.H. Business Park	0.50
5/3/2008	Revisions to PILOT Allocation Agreement re: N.H. Business Park with memo to attys Saunders, Shields, and Dillon	0.75
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: N.H. Business Park	0.40
5/8/2008	Telephone conference with Cleveland re :N .H. Business Park and Roof Contract.	

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Review of Shumaker Contract re: Engineering Services N/ .H. Business Park	0.40
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park 0.50 (Rt. 5 connection, meeting with DOT, water connections, clerk of the works, F.I.L.M.)	0.50
5/12/2008	Review of and revisions to personal Guarantee Letter as prepared by attorney Myers re: N.H. Business park.	1.00
	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park Park.	0.10
5/15/2008	Meeting with Gilligan, Reynolds, cleveland and planner re: N.H. Business Park and other real property matters. (10:45_12)	1.25
	Meeting with Cleveland, Planne and Meagher re: KRCC 2.00 Roof Contract; Shumaker Contracts and N.H. Business Park. (2-4)	2.00
5/19/2008	Memo to Town Board re: N.H. Business Park, Kellogg Road Community Center Roofing Contract	0.30
	Meetingw ith Saunders, Shields, Dillon re: Allocation Agreement. (1-2:45)	1 .75
	Telephone conference with attorney Shields re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone conference with Saunders re : N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Memo to attorney Myers re: Personal Guarantee Letter - N.H. Business Park.	0.30
5/20/2008	Telephone conference with Dan Gilligan re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
5/23/2008	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds and Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park, Preswick Glen Floodplain	1.20
5/27/2008	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Telephone conference with Smith re: Preswick Glen and N.H. Business Park	0.10
5/28/2008	Telephone conference with Gilligan re:N Y Mills Fire Property/ N.H. Business Park	0.30
	Telephone conference with Adler re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Memo to Town Board re:N .H. Business Park.	0.40
5/29/2008	Meeting with Smith re: N.H. Business Park.	0.75
6/2/2008	Prep time line re:N .H. Business Park.	0.40
	Memo to attorney Myers with timeline re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone conference with Smith re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
6/3/2008	Memo to Basile re: Request for Meeting. N/C	0.00
	Memo to attorney Myers re: N.H. Business park.	0.30
	Discussion with Smith re: N.H. Business park	0.10
6/4/2008	Telephone conference with attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park.	0.20
6/5/2008	Memo to attorneys Saunders, Shields and Dillon re: N.H. Business Park.	0.40
6/6/2008	Revisions to memo to attorneys Saunders, Shields and Dillon re: N.H. Business Park	0.40
6/10/2008	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with attorney Shields re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Planner re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
	Telephone conference with Adler re: N.H. Business Park.	0.10
6/11/2008	Telephone conference with Planner re: SDG Contract and N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
6/13/2008	Telephone conference with attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park.	0.20
	Telephone conference with attorney Carol Zenzu (Cameron Group) re: N.H.Business Park.	0.40
6/17/2008	Meeting with Cleveland, Planner and Meagher re: N.H. Business Park, 2.50 F.I.L.M., Consumer Square, DEC Consent Order, SDG Contract and 3 lot subdivision.	2.50
	Meeting with Cleveland Planner Meagher and Adler re:N .H. Business Park	1.00
	Telephone conference with attorney Carol Zenzu re:N .H. Business Park.	0.20
	Prep conditional Board resolution language re :N .H. Business Park.	0.50
	Prep detailed map re:N .H. Business Park.	0.50
6/18/2008	Meeting with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park.	0.50
6/19/2008	Telephone conference with Cleveland re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
6/23/2008	Telephone conference with Shehadi re :N .H. Business Park.	0.40
	Prep status memo re: N.H. Business Park	0.50
	Telephone conference with attorney Carol Zenzu re: N.H. Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
6/24/2008	Telephone conference with Adler re: N.H. Business Park	0.10
	Telephone conference with attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
	Review of and modifications to Agreement for Extension of Water Main re: N.H. Business Park.	0.50
	Telephone conference with Cleveland re : Agreement for Extension of Water Main	0.30
	Telephone conference with Shehadi and attorney Myers re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
6/25/2008	Memo to Cleveland re: Agreement for Extension of Water Main for N.H. Business Park.	0.40
	Revisions to memo to Town Board re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
	Telephone conference with attorney Saunders re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
6/26/2008	Telephone conference with Booth re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
	Meeting with Cleveland, Planner and Meagher re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
	Telephone conference with Booth re: N.H. Business Park.	0.30
	Meeting with Cleveland, Planner and Meagher re: N.H. Business Park	0.20
7/3/2008	Meeting with Reed and Reynolds re: Business Park & DEC Consent Order	0.50
7/7/2008	Telephone Conference with Gilligan re: Business Park	0.40
	Review of correspondence from Gilligan re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Gilligan re: Business Park	0.20
7/8/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with attorney Shields re: Business Park	0.30
	Memo to attorneys Saunders, Shields & Dillon re: Business Park	0.50
7/9/2008	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park, Jewel Ridge DEC Consent Order	0.40
7/14/2008	Telephone Conference with Carol Zenzel re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Planner and Meagher re:Lowe's easement & Business Park	1.75
	Review of Bid Contract #1 re: Business Park	0.30
7/15/2008	Memo to Town Board re: Status of Business Park	0.40

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference with Gilligan re: Business Park	0.40
	Meeting with Gilligan and Adler re: Business Park (12:30 - 1)	0.50
	Meeting with Gilligan, Adler, Reed, Reynolds and Cleveland re: Business Park.	0.75
	Meeting with Cleveland re: Business Park Bid Contract #1	0.20
7/16/2008	Meeting with Cleveland re: DeTraglia Easement, Consumer Square and Business Park	0.30
7/17/2008	Telephone Conference with Gilligan re: Business Park	0.75
	Telephone Conference with attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.30
7/18/2008	Meeting with Cleveland re: Business Park, Shumaker Contracts, Bid Contracts DEC matter, Old Paris Road sewers	1.60
7/21/2008	Meeting with Gilligan re: Business Park (8:30-9:30)	1.00
	Telephone Conference with Atty Dillon re: Business Park	0.40
7/22/2008	Prep status memo and prep for meeting re: Business Park	1.50
	Prep supplement to status report re: Business Park	0.40
	Review of Bid Contract and Insurance materials re: Business Park	0.40
	Memo to Cleveland re: Bid Contract	0.30
	Review of Shumaker Services Contract re: Business Park	0.30
	Memo to Cleveland re: Shumaker Services Contract - Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.20
7/23/2008	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland, Gilligan, Saunders & Dillon re: Business Park (9:30-12)	2.50
7/24/2008	Memo to Cleveland re: Shumaker Contract - Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.20
	Memo to Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland, Gilligan, Dillon and Saunders re: Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Picente re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Planner re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference with Ron Kaye (Costello) re: Business Park	0.10
7/28/2008	Memo to Cleveland re: Business Park - Bid Contract	0.20
	Review of and Revisions to Guarantee Letter re: Business Park	1.00
	Memo to attorneys Saunders, Shields and Dillon re: Business Park	0.30
7/30/2008	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Jewel Ridge and Business Park	0.20
8/1/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.40
	Telephone Conferene with Gilligan re:Business Park, New York Mills Fire Co, and Higby Road Project	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.10
8/4/2008	Review of Survey Map Roads C and D re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Planner re: Business Park and Lowe's Easement	0.10
	Legal Research re: Eminent Domain	1.00
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland, Planner, Adler, and Gilligan re: Status of Business Park (1-2:30)	1.50
8/5/2008	Memo to Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland, Planner, Gilligan re::Business Park	0.30
	Memo to attorney Saunders re: PILOT Allocation Agreement	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Zenzel re:Business Park	0.10
8/6/2008	Meeting with Calogero re: Business Park land Transfer, Sherman Land Transfer and Mallard Brook Lane Land Transfer	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Atty Zenzel re: Business Park Land Transfer	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: Business Park Allocation Agreement	0.40
	Memo to Supervisor Reed re: Business Park - Burrow's Contract	0.20
8/8/2008	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Town Board Agenda and Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Atty Myers re: Business Park Land Transfer	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Shumaker Agreement and Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Atty Zenzel re: Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference with Atty Myers re: Business Park	0.10
8/12/2008	Memo to Cleveland re:Business Park - Bid Contract #1	0.20
	Memo to Planner and Meagher re: Business Park - Transfer of Land for Roads C & D	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Shehadi, Saunders and Myers - re: Business Park - Allocation Agreement and bonding (10-10:45)	0.75
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland, Meagher, Planner, Gilligan and Adler re: Status of Business Park (11:151-2:45)	1.50
8/13/2008	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland re: Business Park, Stormwater	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.10
8/14/2008	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland and Gilligan re: Business Park, Old Paris Road Sewer District and Appler Matter	1.55
8/15/2008	Meeting with Reed, Cleveland, Gilligan, Shama, Szwiek and Hoff re: Business Park (9-10:45)	0.75
	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Planner re:Business Park - Roads C & D	0.10
	Memo to attorney Zenzel re:Business Park - Roads C & D	0.20
8/18/2008	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Reed, Reynolds and Cleveland re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland and Shehadi re: Business Park (4-5:30)	1.50
	Meeting with Adler re: Business Park	0.20
8/19/2008	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Cleveland and Adler re: Business Park (8-10)	2.00
	Memo to Meagher and Planner re:Business Park - Roads C & D	0.20
8/22/2008	Memo to Candy Currier re: Business Park [Cleveland secretary]	0.10
8/25/2008	Telephone Conference with attorney Saunders re: Business Park - Allocation Agreement	0.10
8/26/2008	Meeting with Booth, Cleveland, Meagher and Planner re: Business Park, SDG Contract, COR Easement, Applewood Road Dedication, Lowe's Road Dedication, Jewel Ridge, Cherrywood, Article 78 (8:30-11:30)	3.00
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.30
8/27/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Reed re: Business Park, FOIL responses, Business Park Highway Superintendent appointment	0.40
8/29/2008	Meeting with Gilligan, Reed, Reynolds, and Cleveland re: Business Park (2:30-5)	2.50
	Meeting with Adler re: Business Park	1.00
9/2/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.20
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Gilligan and Adler re: Business Park (3-5)	2.00
9/3/2008	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park, Stormwater Mgmt.	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.20
9/4/2008	Memo to Town Board re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Cleveland, Planner, Meagher, Arnold and Philo re: Consumer Square and Business Park (9-11)	2.00
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Gail Young re: FOIL request - PILOT Agreement	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re:Business Park, FOIL responses and Longworth Acres Drainage District	0.30
9/5/2008	Telephone Conference with Gilligan and Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Planner, Reed and Reynolds re:Business Park, FILM, Longworth Acres and Office Space	0.50
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.40
	Meeting with Gilligan, Reed and Reynolds re: Business Park (1-2:30)	1.50
	Telephone Conference with Calogero re: Business Park - Roads C and D	0.10
	Meeting with Picente re: Business Park	1.00
9/6/2008	Meeting with Adler re: Business Park	1.00
9/8/2008	Meeting with Adler re: Business Park	1.00

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds and Cleveland re: Business Park (10-11:30)	1.50
9/9/2008	Telephone Conference with attorney Cully re: Preswick Glen and Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Phlio, Rayhill, Arnold, Yagey, Reynolds, Planner, Cleveland, Reed re: Office Space and Business Park (9:30-11:15)	1.75
	Meeting with Reed Reynolds, Planner and Cleveland re: Business Park	2.00
	Meeting with Adler re: Business Park	1.00
9/10/2008	Prep response to FOIL request re: PILOT Agreement	0.75
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.20
9/11/2008	Meeting with Reed and Cleveland re: Sewer Matters and Business Park (8:15 - 9:30)	1.20
	Meeting with Reed, Gillligan, Adler, Reynolds and Planner re: Business Park (10-12)	2.00
	Memo to Reed re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.50
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Shehadi re: Business Park	0.20
9/12/2008	Telephone Conference with Gilligan re: Business Park	0.40
	Memo to Reed, Reynolds, Gilligan and Adler re: Business Park	0.75
	Meeting with Picente re: Business Park (5 - 6)	1.00
9/13/2008	Meeting with Krupa re: Business Park, Office Space, F.I.L.M.	1.50
9/15/2008	Meeting with NYSDOT, Town Officials and others re:Business Park (10-11:30)	1.50
	Memo to Supervisor Reed re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Planner re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Gilligan and Adler re: Business Park (11:30 - 11:45)	0.20
	Meeting with Adler and Griffo re: Business Park (11:45-12)	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park and F.O.I.L response	0.10
9/16/2008	Memo to Adler re: Business Park	0.10
9/18/2008	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.10
9/19/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Gilligan, Reynolds, Planner and Cleveland re: Business Park (9:30 - 11)	1.50
	Meeting with Picente, DiMeo, Reynolds, Cleveland, Caruso, Gilligan, Shields, Dillon, Saunders, Planner, Adler and Payne re: Business Park (11 - 1:30)	2.50
	Meeting with Reynolds, Cleveland and Planner re: Business Park	0.50
9/23/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.40
9/24/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.10
9/25/2008	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds and Cleveland re: Business Park (11:15 - 12:45)	1.50
9/26/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park (9 - 11:30)	1.50
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park (9-11)	2.00
	Meeting with Attorneys Saunders and Dillon re: Business Park (4-5:45)	1.75
9/27/2008	Prep for Town Board Meeting re: Business Park	2.00
9/28/2008	Meeting with Cleveland re: Business Park	1.00
	Memo to Attorneys Saunders, Shields and Dillon re: Business Park	0.75
9/29/2008	Review and Revise Smith Affadavit re: Business Park	0.50
	Review and Revise Reed Letter re: Business Park	0.40
	Memo to Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.20
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds and Cleveland re: Business Park (4 - 5:30)	1.50
9/30/2008	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Arnold re: Business Park and Consumer Square	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	1.00
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds and Cleveland re: Business Park (4 - 5:30)	1.50
10/1/2008	Revisions to Smith Affadavit re: Business Park	0.10
10/2/2008	Meeting with Smith to review Affadavit re: Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference with Myers re: Business Park	0.30
	Prep. Agreement for Incidental Costs re: Business Park	2.00
	Memo to Town Board re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
10/3/2008	Telephone Conference with D'Onofrio re: Business Park	0.20
10/4/2008	Revisions to Agreement and Individual Guaranty; prep proposed Town Board Resolution; and preparation for presentation at Special Town Board Meeting re: Business Park	4.00
10/5/2008	Review of and Revisions to Allocation Agreement re: Business Park	2.50
	Prep. Exhibits to Allocation Agreement re: Business Park	1.00
	Meeting with Attorney Saunders re: Allocation Agreement (4:00 - 6:00)	2.00
10/6/2008	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Adler re: Agreement and Individual Guaranty	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Agreement and Individual Guaranty	0.20
	Meeting with Reed and Cleveland re: Business Park, DEC Consent Order, Sitrin Project, Consumer Square	1.50
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Letter of Credit - Business Park	0.40
	Review of Revised Allocation Agreement re: Business Park	1.00
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Zenzel re: Business Park	0.20
	Meeting with Saunders and Dillon re: Allocation Agreement	1.00
	Meeting with Gilligan and Reynolds re: Allocation Agreement (7.45 - 10:00)	2.25
10/7/2008	Revisions to Allocation Agreement, Agreement and Individual Guaranty and Town Board Resolution	2.00
	Meeting with Attorney Saunders re: Allocation Agreement (11:00 - 1:00)	2.00
	Memo to Town Board re: Allocation Agreement and related documents	0.30
10/16/2008	Telephone Conference with Attorney Shields re: Allocation Agreement	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.30
10/17/2008	Memo to Town Board re: Business Park	0.30

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Dillon re: Allocation Agreement	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: COR Road Dedication/Traffic Signal/ Easement/Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
10/18/2008	Meeting with Adler re: Business Park	1.00
10/19/2008	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park and F.I.L.M.	0.40
10/20/2008	Memo to Gail Young re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Town Board re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Dillon re: Business Park	0.10
10/21/2008	Revisions to Agreement and Individual Guaranty re: Business Park	0.40
	Memo with Adler re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
10/22/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Cleveland re: Business Park	0.10
10/24/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
10/27/2008	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10
10/28/2008	Telephone Conference with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.20
	Memo to Adler re: Business Park	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Business Park, F.I.L.M., and town bonds	0.40
	Telephone Conference wth Attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.20
10/29/2008	Meeting with Reed and Reynolds re:Business Park, litigation matter, FILM and office space (9:30 - 10:30)	1.00
	Memo to Woodland re: Job Guaranty Agreement - The Hartford	0.10
10/30/2008	Memo to Planner and Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference wth Calogero re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Adler re: Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
10/31/2008	Telephone Conference re: Business Park	0.10
11/3/2008	Memo to Planner, Meagher and Booth re: Business Park	0.20
	Memo to Chief Philo, Meagher and Planner re: Seneca Tpke	0.10
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.40
	Meeting with Booth, Meagher and Planner re: Lowe's and Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference wth Booth re: Business Park	0.10
11/4/2008	Telephone Conference with Meagher re:Lowe's and Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Planner and Meagher re:Lowe's and Business Park (2:00 - 4:00)	2.00
11/5/2008	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Burrows, Adler and Valenti re: Business Park (11:00 - 12:45)	1.75
11/10/2008	Memo to Attorney Myers re: FILM	0.10
	Memo to Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.10
11/11/2008	Memo to Linda Lubey and Steve Zwyiak re: Temp Traffic Signal - Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference wtih Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.10
11/14/2008	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Meagher re:Cragnolin, IMA NYM, Roads C & D Business Park	0.20
11/17/2008	Review of Letter of Credit and memo to Attorney Myers re:Business Park	0.30
	Review of Agreement and Individual Guaranty and memo to Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference wth Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10
11/18/2008	Meeting with Meagher, Booth, Planner and Reed re: Business Park, C of O, Walmart Subdivision	1.25
	Memo to Meagher and Planner re:Business Park - Bid Contract #1	0.10
11/22/2008	Meeting with Adler re: Business Park	1.00
11/24/2008	Telephone Conference with Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Letter of Credit, Guaranty, Interference with Contract, F.I.L.M.	0.20
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
11/25/2008	Meeting with Meagher re:Sherman Land Transfer, Business Park and Consumer Square	0.30
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10
12/1/2008	Memo to Booth, Planner and Meagher re: Business Park	0.40
	Memo to Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.30
12/2/2008	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Confernece with Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Booth re: C of O re: The Hartford	0.10
12/3/2008	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10
12/4/2008	Telephone Conference with Gail Young re: Town Board resolution for the Business Park - Dedication of roads C & D	0.10
12/4/2008	Meeting with Booth re: C of O's, Business Park	0.30
	Meeting with Reynolds re: Business Park, 19 Campion, Fairbrother personnel matter, Elefante personnel matter, DEC Consent Order and F.I.L.M.	0.90
12/5/2008	Meeting with Meagher and Sherman re: Business Park (7:30 - 9:30)	2.00
12/8/2008	Prep for Town Board Meeting re: Business Park	1.00
	Meeting with Planner, Meagher, Sherman Re: Consumer Square, Subdivision Walmart and Business Park (3:00 - 5:00)	2.00
12/8/2008	Meeting with Meagher and Planner re: Business Park (2:00 - 5:00)	3.00
12/9/2008	Revisions to easement - Re: Road C - Business Park	5.00
12/10/2008	Memo to Attorney Myers re: Letter of Credit - Business Park	0.10
	Revisions ot Easement Agreement re: Business Park	1.00
	Prep resolution re: Business Park - Roads C & D Dedication	1.50
	Meeting with Meagher re: Business Park and Sherman Land Transfer	1.50
12/11/2008	Review Map and legal description and prep letter to National Grid re: Business Park	0.40
	Telephone Conference to Attorney Myers re:Bond Resolution - Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Review Bond Resolution re: Business Park	0.40
	Revisions to Town Board resolution re: Dedication of Roads C & D and authorization to pay Bid Contract #1	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Bond Resolution	0.10
12/12/2008	Meeting with Planner, Smith, Meagher and OC Planning Dept.	2.00
	Telephone Conference with Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Gail Young re: Bond Resolution	0.10
12/15/2008	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds re: Fairbrother matter, Business Park, Planning Board, 19 Campion Road (10:00 - 12:00)	2.00
	Telephone Conference with Frank Sciortino re: Business Park - National Grid Parcel	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: LOC and Bond Resolution	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Allocation Agreement	0.40
	Memo to Attorney Zenzel re: Easement Agreement - Business Park	0.10
12/16/2008	Telephone Conference with Booth re: Business Park	0.10
12/17/2008	Telephone Conference with Meagher re: Business Park and Sherman Land Transfer	0.10
	Meeting with Meagher re: Business Park	0.75
	Memo to Meagher re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Calogero Re: Roads C & D, Crown Atlantic and National Grid Parcels	0.20
	Memo to Meagher re:Roads C & D, Crown Atlantic and National Grid Parcels	0.10
12/18/2008	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference wth Shehadi re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Meagher re: Business Park	0.60
	Meeting with Calogero re: Business Park - land transfers	1.00
12/19/2008	Telephone Conference wth Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Business Park	0.10
	Review of Emails re: Business Park	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference wth Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
1/9/2009	Telephone Conference wth Attorney Shields re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10
1/12/2009	Telephone Conference with Tom Calogero re: Business Park	0.10
	Review of Land Transfer and road dedication files Re: Sherman, Roads A & B, Crown Atlantic, Roads C & D, National Grid and Sitrin Lane	1.50
	Memo to Meagher re: Rpad Dedications	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Calogero re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Meagher re: Rpad Dedications	0.10
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10
1/13/2009	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.40
	Prep town board resolution re: dedication of roads A & B in Business Park	1.50
	Telephone Conference wth Adler re: Business Park	0.30
	Meeting with Sherman and Meagher re:Sitrin Lane and Roads A & B dedication	0.50
	Meeting with Reed & Reynolds and Personnel matters	1.75
1/15/2009	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Adler & Trainor re: Business Park	1.50
1/16/2009	Revisions to Town Board Resolution Road A	0.20
	Memo to Gail Young Re. Town Board Resolution Road A	0.10
	Meeting with Reed, Reynolds, Adler & Trainor re: Business Park	2.50
1/19/2009	Review of and revisions to Easement Agreement Road A	0.50
	Memo to Meagher re: Easement Agreement Road A	0.20
1/21/2009	Prep Allocation Agreement for Signatures re: Business Park	1.00
	Memo to Woodland re: Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re:PILOT Allocation Agreement re: Business Park	0.20

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Dillon re:PILOT Allocation Agreement re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re:Letter of Credit - Business Park	0.10
1/22/2009	Meeting with Meagher Re: Easement Agreement - Road A - Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Shawna (EDGE) re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Meagher re: Sherman and Business Park	0.10
1/23/2009	Memo to Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
1/26/2009	Telephone Conference with Carol Ryan re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Reed re: Business Park (10:30 - 12:00)	1.50
1/27/2009	Meeting with Reynolds re: Business Park (8:00 - 9:30)	1.50
	Meeting with Reed and Reynolds re: Business Park (10:30 - 12:00)	1.50
	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park	0.10
1/28/2009	Meeting with Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
1/30/2009	Memo to Planner and Meagher re: Business Park	0.10
	Memo to Attorney Myers re: LOC - Business Park	0.20
	Telephone Conference with attorney Myers re:LOC, Ad in Town Crier and FILM	0.30
2/2/2009	Prep Agreement Allocating PILOT payments for copying and assembly	1.00
2/3/2009	Memo to Attorney Zenzel re:National Grid Parcel - Business Park	0.20
2/4/2009	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Sitirn Cottages and Business Park	0.40
	Meeting with Adler - Business Park	1.50
2/5/2009	Memo to Gail Young re: Lawrence request for Agreement and Individual Guaranty	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Gail Young re:Wiatr/Lawrence request for Hearing re: Feb. 10 vote	0.10
	Meeting with Gail Young re: Wiatr/Lawrence request for Hearing	0.10
	Review of Town Crier Ad and Request for Ethics Hearing	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Myers re: Request for Hearing	0.20
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: NYRI donation to EDGE and PILOT Allocation Agreement	0.10
2/6/2009	Review of ads, emails and information and prep memo to Attorney Myers	

DATE	DESCRIPTION	TIME
	re: Request for Hearing	1.00
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Sardelli re: County Ethics - Wiatr request for Hearing	0.10
	Memo to Town Board re: Request for Hearing Wiatr/Lawrence	0.20
2/9/2009	Memo to Attorney Dillon re:Business Park	0.30
	Telephone conference with Shehadi re: Feb.10 vote	0.10
2/19/2009	Telephone Conference with Adler re: Business Park and Sitrin Cottages	0.10
2/20/2009	Telephone Conference with Attorney Shields re: Allocation Agreement Business Park	0.10
	Pick up Allocation Agreement from Picente and deliver to Nole	0.50
2/23/2009	Meeting with Gail Young re: Business Park	0.10
	Meeting with Carol Ryan re: Business Park	0.10
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Saunders re: Business Park	0.30
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Shields re: Business Park	0.10
2/24/2009	Telephone Conference with Attorney Shields re: Allocation Agreement - Business Park	0.40
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Dillon re: Business Park	0.10
2/25/2009	Meeting with Meagher and Planner re: DEC Consent Order, FILM, Stimulus Package for New Hartford and Business Park	1.15
	Telephone Conference with Attorney Shields re: Allocation Agreement Business Park	0.10
		408.55

408.55 hours @ 150.00 per hour

\$61,282.50